RESOLUTION 2013-159

RESOLUTION OF THE TOWNSHIP OF BARNEGAT,
COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY
AUTHORIZING REIMBURSEMENT FOR THE
REPLACEMENT OF A BASKETBALL HOOP

BE IT RESOLVED, by the Township Committee of the Township of
Barnegat, County of Ocean, State of New Jersey that the Finance Office is
hereby directed to issue a check to the following for the replacement of a
Basketball Hoop that was damaged while Public Works was performing leaf
collection in the fall of 2012:

Brian Huhn $200.09
15 Willow Tree Court

CERTIFICATION

I, Sharon L. Auer, Acting Municipal Clerk of the Township of Barnegat, County of
Ocean , State of New Jersey do hereby certify that the foregoing resolution was
duly adopted by the Barnegat Township Committee at their regular meeting held
on the 1% day of April, 2013, in the Municipal Complex, 900 West Bay Avenue,
Barnegat, New Jersey.
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Sharon L. Auer
Acting Municipal Clerk
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CLAIMANT'S CERTIF[CATION AND DECLARATION

or received by any person or persons with the knowledge of this claimant in connection with the above claim; that the amount therein stated is justly due and owing; and that the amourit charged is a reasonable one.
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L 1 do solemnly declare and certify under the penalties of law that the within bill is correct in all its particulars; that the articles have been furished or services rendered as stated therein; that no bonus has been given
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Re: Basketball Hoop http://10.0.0.102/egroupware/index.php?menuaction=felamimail.vidisp...
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Re: Basketball Hoop

From: Brian.Huhn@us.tdk-lambda.com
To: Sharon Auer <sharon@barnegat.net>
Date: 03/18/2013 - 08:28:04 am

I can drop off the receipt on my way home from work. | should be there around 5:45.
Is there a certain place | should go?

Do | just drop it off or ask for you (or will you be in the meeting at that time)?

I had a typo... it cost $200, not $202. Even more savings.

Brian

From: Sharon Auer <sharon@barnegat.net>
To: Brian.Huhn@us.tdk-lambda.com

Date: 03/18/2013 08:12 AM

Subject: Re: Basketball Hoop

Hi Brian,

| was wondering what was going on. Thank you for waiting for it to go on sale. That was great!
Are you going to mail me the receipt? then | will get a voucher out to you for your signature. We
are open until 7:30 PM tonight as we have a committee meeting. Let me know.

Sharon

---------------- original message
From: Brian.Huhn@us.tdk-lambda.com
To: "Sharon Auer" <sharon@barnegat.net>
Date: Mon, 18 Mar 2013 08:02:09 -0400

Good Morning Sharon,

Thank you again for all that you have done with this situation.

I finally was able to get a basketball hoop from Walmart. Guess they were not in season during the winter, the store
never had one. | was able to get one that was cheaper than the originally quoted $250. | waited for one that was

equivalent to go on sale and only paid $202 with tax.
I will send out the receipt to your attention and include my address so the voucher can be sent.

| assume it will have to wait for the next upcoming meeting to get approved.
Regards,
Brian Huhn

From: Sharon Auer <sharon@barnegat.net>
To: Brian.Huhn@us .tdk-lambda.com

Date: 01/29/2013 09:58 AM

Subject: Re: Basketball Hoop

3/18/2013 10:38 AM



